June 28, 2013 meeting of the Monroe County Highway Committee


Meeting called to order at 9:03 a.m., by Chairman James Schroeder.

Members present:  James Schroeder, Gene Treu, and Dale Greeno.
Members absent:  Daniel Olson and James Rice.
Others present:  Highway Commissioner – Jack Dittmar, Recording Secretary – Becky Pitel, Town of Wells Chairman - Dennis Hemmersbach (Item I. only), Town of Wells Supervisor – Greg Schmitz (Item I. only), CTH Q Landowner - Junior Vieth (Items I.-IV.only,skipped V.-VI. & Item VII.), and Mathy Construction Co. & Milestone Materials of Onalaska Vice President – Tony Tomashek (Items VI. & VII. only).
I. Period of Public Comment – Chairman Dennis Hemmersbach and Supervisor Greg Schmitz came on behalf of the Town of Wells to express interest in one of the two graders that the County may be looking at replacing.  Dennis stated that the Town of Wells is more interested in the 6 wheel drive John Deere grader if the price is right.  At this time the Town of Wells is willing to hold off on repairing their present grader until they know if the county will be replacing a grader.  Jack Dittmar explained to the Committee that we are looking at grader demonstrations in July and that the Town of Sparta has also looked at the graders we may be replacing.  Gene Treu inquired what the procedure would be for the sale of this equipment.  Jack explained that Wisconsin Statutes do not require the Highway Committee to have public bids.  Dittmar also suggested that the county receive trade in prices with the bids for the new equipment and acquire an outright purchase price bid so the Committee can easily come up with a fair price for the equipment being replaced.
II. Motion to approve the minutes of the regular May 17, 2013 meeting made by Dale Greeno, seconded by Gene Treu.  All ayes, motion carried.  
III. Payroll presented as follows:


Check Date:  05/30/2013 *Includes Back Pay

Check Date:  06/13/2013
· Field Personnel 
$72,002.79


●  Field Personnel
$59,459.25
· Administration 
$12,836.60


●  Administration
$10,557.61
· Total

$84,839.39


●  TOTAL

$70,016.86
            Check Date:  06/27/2013 


· Field Personnel 
$65,157.95




· Administration 
$10,833.03




· Total

$75,990.98
IV. Motion made by Gene Treu, seconded by Dale Greeno, to approve the early paid vouchers in the amount of $13,533.69, credit card bills in the amount of $3,375.52, insurance premium in the amount of $77,589.00 and the vouchers payable in the amount of $171,530.56.  All ayes, motion carried.  
 
>>>Skipped Agenda Items V. & VI.<<<

VII.
CTH Q Hill
Junior Vieth stated to the Committee that he is concerned with rock falling onto the highway from his property and who would actually be liable.  Vieth’s insurance company wrote a letter to Monroe County’s insurance company in regards to this matter as well.  Junior stated that Jack Dittmar had talked to him previously about doing and easement to his property outside of the right-of-way.  Junior was not opposed to the idea but will only allow a 2 year easement and it may need to be extended depending on the rain.  Chair Jim Schroeder inquired to Vieth as to what his insurance company’s response was to the concern and the liability.  Junior stated that his insurance company told him that his (Vieth’s) insurance would be liable unless they can prove that the cut to the hill was done wrong.  The Committee discussed the matter and inquired of Dittmar’s thoughts.  Jack feels that it would cost a minimum of $100K to do anything minor and closer to $300K to just slope the rock back about 20 feet at the top.  He also stated that the county’s insurance representative looked at the hill last week and feels we are taking necessary precautions and his only suggestion was to have another private engineer’s opinion on the design of the hill.  Gene Treu inquired if an easement would release Junior Vieth from the liability.  Jack stated that even our insurance company representative felt Junior would have limited liability with the hill in its current condition as how would anyone prove if dirt/rocks came from within or outside of the right-of-way.  But, as the Committee suggested a little over a year ago, Jack is proposing a permanent limited easement of 60 feet on each side of the existing permanent 80 feet wide deeded right-of-way which would result in a 100’ wide strip on each side of the centerline.  The Committee discussed a 2 year easement with a possible renewal.  Vice President from Mathy Construction and Milestone Materials happened to arrive in the middle of the discussion of the CTH Q hill and asked if he could make a suggestion.  Tony Tomashek suggested the possibility of using a cyclone mesh over the face of the rock, which is normally used during blasting and mining.  Dale Greeno would like to see the boring tests and amount of time & dollars being spend clearing this area yearly at next month’s meeting.  Gene Treu inquired to Junior Vieth if he would be okay with a 2 year renewable easement for 100 foot per side from the center of the highway.  Vieth is not opposed at this time.  Gene Treu made a motion to bring back the County Highway Q hill next meeting with burst matting information, angle of pitch determined by rock type and with the consideration of a 2 year renewable easement for 100 foot per side from the center of the highway, seconded by Dale Greeno.  All ayes, motion carried.
V. Mathy Construction CTH S Highway Agreement 

Tony Tomashek, Vice President of Milestone Materials and Mathy Construction of Onalaska came to the Committee to discuss the sand mine that they are looking at constructing in the Town of Little Falls.  Tony explained to the Committee that they have already acquired a conditional use permit from the county with limitation on hauling and operating days and times and loads per day.  Tomashek also stated that they have done a traffic impact analysis for safety standards.  The sand pit they are constructing would only be for mining purposes and would not be as large as the Unimin or U.S. Silica sand processing facilities which are currently operating in the County.  Long term the pit will be reclaimed into a lake.  The agreement states that Mathy will pulverize, resurface, and shoulder CTH S from STH 27 to Camp Ave, with maintenance such as crack filling to follow.  But Tony is proposing only milling off about 1.5 inches and putting back on 2.5 inches of new asphalt.  The county would still be responsible for plowing and mowing.  James Schroeder inquired if Milestone and Mathy would consider using Base One Aggregate to test on a ½ mile to a mile.  Tomashek was not opposed to the idea if they would have to pulverize the highway, but he is leaning towards milling it.  Gene Treu made a motion to authorize the Commissioner to sign the agreement as proposed and work with Mathy on CTH S improvements, seconded by Dale Greeno.  All ayes, motion carried.

V. Commissioner’s Report

· Projects:
· County crews:  patched potholes, cleaned various ditches, replaced numerous culverts, hydro-seeded all disturbed areas, swept intersections & bridges & curves, started mowing, and just started on the CTH PP reconditioning project.

· State crews:  repaired a bridge deck on I-94, lined & replaced some x-culverts,  cleaned bridges, patched I-94 between Tomah & Warrens, repaired guardrail, fixed interstate fences, started and are almost finished mowing, cleaned out some ditches, and graded shoulders.

· Jackson County Highway Dept. crews sprayed around guardrail on all highways.

· Jack sent comments for the Property & Purchasing Committee regarding the 2013 tax delinquent foreclosure properties.

· Jack attended the STH 27 Corridor Study Local Officials meeting on May 22.

· We received a letter from the WDOT on the reconstruction of I-94 from Tomah to Warrens.  Temporary paving will take place late this summer to minimize the amount of pothole patching we currently perform and allow for bi‑directional traffic when reconstruction starts in 2014.  Reconstruction will finish in 2016.        
· **Jack just applied for Federal Aid funding for construction only of 6 bridges, one each for the Towns of Tomah & Portland and four on our CTH system with a total estimated construction cost of almost $2 million dollars.  Design will be 100% locally funded.  Applications are prioritized with the two Town bridges being the lowest.  Funding is distributed based on a County’s allotment and priority. 
· **Jack also applied for Federal Aid funding to concrete CTH PP from I-94 to USH 12.  This funding is from a new Local Freight Pilot Initiative that grew out of the Governor’s Second Annual Freight Summit.  This section of CTH PP serves multiple trucking businesses and as a freight connection between the interstate & USH 12.  The asphalt on a portion of this segment is only 6 years old and already breaking up due to the heavy truck traffic.  Concrete would be a permanent fix and this project fits the ranking criteria very well.
· Equipment:

-
Our skid steer loader trailer is here. 

· Facilities:

· Nothing to report.
· **Our parts department bar coding is online and running well.
· Budget: 

· April & May monthly budget analysis (see handouts).  Continue to be slightly over historic averages (about $85K at the end of May) solely due to the long winter.

· Cash Balance is in great shape and will be close to historic averages after the County Board approved May budget adjustment of $750K is deducted.
· **The sand pit property lease payment from ATC arrived in yesterday’s mail.
· Personnel: 

· One of our Public Works Laborers continues working full-time for the Maint. Dept.

· One additional Public Works Laborer worked full-time for Maintenance to fill in until the Maintenance Department’s new employee started last week. 

· All of our Public Works Laborers have mowed for the Maintenance Department (one employee per week for two days each week).

Jim Schroeder & Jack attended an informative summer highway conference.
· **Our Signperson tragically died last week Sunday and his funeral was last Friday.

** = added to report during meeting
VIII. 2013 Blade Bids
Copies of the subject summary sheets were attached with the agenda of bids publicly opened on Tuesday, June 18, 2013.  Bids came in as follows:  

	Blade Bid Summary Sheet

	

	DESCRIPTION
	BURKE
	GRAY'S
	FABCO
	WINTER

	1/2" x 6" x 12' cover 
	 $       877.80 
	 $  1,157.00 
	 No Bid 
	 $   1,038.70 

	3/4” x 6” x 5’ CB Bvl GRDR
	 $    2,820.80 
	 $  3,258.00 
	 No Bid 
	 No Bid 

	3/4” x 6” x 3’ CB
	 $    3,090.60 
	 $  3,482.80 
	 $   2,952.00 
	 $   3,477.00 

	3/4” x 6” x 4’ CB
	 $   12,362.40 
	 $13,930.80 
	 $ 11,562.60 
	 $ 13,908.00 

	3’ Rubber CB  ( JOMA )
	 $   11,625.00 
	 No Bid 
	 No Bid 
	 No Bid 

	4’ Rubber CB  ( JOMA )
	 $   31,000.00 
	  No Bid  
	  No Bid  
	  No Bid  

	1” x 8” x 4’ HT
	 $    5,562.00 
	 $  4,932.00 
	 $   3,978.00 
	 $   6,283.50 

	1” x 8” x 5’ HT
	 $    2,731.00 
	 $  2,466.00 
	 $   1,955.20 
	 $   3,141.60 

	1” x 8” x 6’ HT
	 $    4,855.80 
	 $  4,438.80 
	 $   3,478.20 
	 $   5,655.00 

	1" x 8" x 7' HT
	 $    3,743.40 
	 $  3,452.40 
	 $   2,682.80 
	 $   4,398.40 

	1” x 8” x 8’ HT
	 $    6,374.10 
	 $  5,918.40 
	 $   4,569.90 
	 $   7,540.20 

	1" x 8" x 9' HT
	 $    2,377.90 
	 $  2,219.40 
	 No Bid 
	 $   2,827.50 

	3/4” x 8” x 5’ HT
	 $    1,026.90 
	 $     945.00 
	 $      741.20 
	 $   1,161.60 

	3/4” x 8” x 6’ HT
	 $    1,212.30 
	 $  1,134.10 
	 $      878.20 
	 $   1,393.90 

	3/4” x 8” x 8’ HT
	 $    1,583.00 
	 $  1,512.10 
	 $   1,147.40 
	 $   1,858.60 

	GRAND TOTAL
	 $   91,243.00 
	 $48,846.80 
	 $ 33,945.50 
	 $ 52,684.00 

	LAST DATE PIRCE WILL BE HONORED:
	30-Jun-13
	18-Jul-13
	30-Jun-13
	31-Aug-13


Dale Greeno made a motion to accept the only bid for rubber blades from Burke Truck & Equipment for $42,625.00, seconded by Gene Treu.  All ayes, motion carried.
Gene Treu made a motion to accept the low complete bid for the remaining (i.e. steel) blades from Burke Truck & Equipment for $48,618.00, seconded by Dale Greeno.  All ayes, motion carried.
IX. Mowing
The Committee discussed this year’s weather and the present condition of the right-of-ways.  Jim Schroeder feels that the county should mow twice this year.  Gene Treu made a motion to mow 2 times this year due to the high amount of rain we have already had, seconded by Dale Greeno.  All ayes, motion carried.

VIII. Hired Trucking
The Committee discussed the need for outside hired trucking.  Jack explained that our employees have always been very dedicated to their jobs which means in the winter they take very few vacations so they can be here for snowplowing.  With this winter being very long, many of our employees are just now taking their vacations so we will be very thin on staff this summer.  We have used hired trucking in the past on an as need basis for trucking to our reconditioning projects.  We put out bids for hourly rates (total for labor & truck) and compile a call list of bids from lowest hourly rate per ton to highest and then work down the list until our needs are met.  This has worked very well in the past and the last time we bid was 2006.  Gene likes the idea of putting our retired employees back in our trucks.  Gene Treu made a motion to get bids for 2013 hired trucking and explore on call retired highway employees working for the Department, seconded by Dale Greeno.  All ayes, motion carried.
IX. BASE ONE Aggregate Base Stabilizer Test

The Committee discussed testing this product on one of our CTHs.  Jack stated that you would need to mill the road twice, add Base One, grade, roll, and single sealcoat which would cost about $50k per mile.  Approximately another $25K per mile would be needed to replace bad culverts and fix a few minor soft spots.  Jack suggested testing this material on CTH N between CTH W & CTH A as it is a highway the Committee gets a lot of calls about.  Gene Treu made a motion to do up to 2 miles of Base One Aggregate with a single seal as a test on CTH N between CTH W & CTH A, seconded by Dale Greeno.  All ayes, motion carried.
X. Future Agenda Items
None at this time.
XI. 10:30 am – 1:00 pm – Highway Tour: Northeastern corner of County
The tour was rescheduled to next month’s meeting due to time constraints and two Committee members being absent.

Motion to adjourn at 10:19 a.m. made by Dale Greeno, seconded by Gene Treu.   All ayes, motion carried.
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